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LINE ITEM 

NO.
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RINGS (HEIGHT)
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PRICE PER 

EACH 1 

YEAR

PRICE PER 

EACH   3 

YEARS

EXTENDED 
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EACH (1 
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EACH   3 
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PRICE

1 1” 100 NO BID  $       134.10  $   13,410.00  $     146.35  $     146.35  $       14,635.00 

2 1 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       138.42  $        692.10  $     152.72  $     152.72  $            763.60 

3 1 1/2" 100 NO BID  $       141.82  $   14,182.00  $     156.57  $     156.57  $       15,657.00 

4 1 3/4" 5 NO BID  $       145.93  $        729.65  $     166.29  $     166.29  $            831.45 

5 2" 600 NO BID  $       148.20  $   88,920.00  $     149.32  $     149.32  $       89,592.00 

6 2 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       154.73  $        773.65  $     175.38  $     175.38  $            876.90 

7 2 ½” 5 NO BID  $       160.64  $        803.20  $     179.46  $     179.46  $            897.30 

8 3” 5 NO BID  $       153.55  $        767.75  $     175.56  $     175.56  $            877.80 

9 3 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       169.28  $        846.40  $     188.30  $     188.30  $            941.50 

10 3 ½” 5 NO BID  $       164.16  $        820.80  $     183.92  $     183.92  $            919.60 

11 3 ¾” 5 NO BID  $       183.89  $        919.45  $     205.81  $     205.81  $         1,029.05 

12 3” 5 NO BID  $       153.55  $        767.75  NO BID  NO BID 

13 4” 5 NO BID  $       192.60  $        963.00  $     214.57  $     214.57  $         1,072.85 

14 4 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       213.25  $     1,066.25  $     235.41  $     235.41  $         1,177.05 

15 4 ½” 5 NO BID  $       215.66  $     1,078.30  $     240.32  $     240.32  $         1,201.60 

16 4 ¾” 5 NO BID  $       219.00  $     1,095.00  $     245.22  $     245.22  $         1,226.10 

17 5” 5 NO BID  $       222.80  $     1,114.00  $     250.13  $     250.13  $         1,250.65 

18 5 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       248.75  $     1,243.75  $     277.31  $     277.31  $         1,386.55 

19 5 ½” 5 NO BID  $       251.60  $     1,258.00  $     277.31  $     277.31  $         1,386.55 

20 5 ¾” 5 NO BID  $       255.50  $     1,277.50  $     290.21  $     290.21  $         1,451.05 

21 6” 5 NO BID  $       256.79  $     1,283.95  $     290.21  $     290.21  $         1,451.05 

22 6 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       301.00  $     1,505.00  $     335.35  $     335.35  $         1,676.75 

23 6 ½” 5 NO BID  $       311.25  $     1,556.25  $     348.25  $     348.25  $         1,741.25 

24 6 ¾” 5 NO BID  $       353.87  $     1,769.35  $     399.84  $     399.84  $         1,999.20 

25 7” 5 NO BID  $       383.67  $     1,918.35  $     452.64  $     452.64  $         2,263.20 

26 7 ¼” 5 NO BID  $       401.10  $     2,005.50  $     451.44  $     451.44  $         2,257.20 

27 7 ½” 5 NO BID  $       432.20  $     2,161.00  $     483.68  $     483.68  $         2,418.40 

28 7¾” 5 NO BID  $       438.66  $     2,193.30  $     490.13  $     490.13  $         2,450.65 

29 8” 5 NO BID  $       441.00  $     2,205.00  $     490.13  $     490.13  $         2,450.65 

30  9” 5 NO BID  $       445.00  $     2,225.00  $     496.58  $     496.58  $         2,482.90 

31 10" 5 NO BID  $       449.00  $     2,245.00  $     501.70  $     501.70  $         2,508.50 

32 11" 5 NO BID  $       501.60  $     2,508.00  $     561.60  $     561.60  $         2,808.00 

33 12" 5 NO BID  $       507.22  $     2,536.10  $     561.60  $     561.60  $         2,808.00 

34 13” 5 NO BID  $       511.16  $     2,555.80  $     565.81  $     565.81  $         2,829.05 

35 14” 5 NO BID  $       577.20  $     2,886.00  $     642.53  $     642.53  $         3,212.65 

36 15” 5 NO BID  $       598.00  $     2,990.00  $     661.71  $     661.71  $         3,308.55 

 $ 167,272.15  $     175,839.60 
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PORT CITY PIPE INC. P.O. BOX 850356 MOBILE AL 36685 /CONTACT: DANIEL R. SMITH  

PH: 1 (800) 959-6921 FAX: (251) 607-0358 EMAIL: REGGIE@PORTCITYPIPE.COM

EJ USA Inc. 301 Spring Street, East Jordan, MI, 49727; Richard Brandell 800-874-4100 

FAX 231-536-4458 EMAIL: US.BIDS@EJCO.COM

MANHOLE RISER RINGS

Charles Lindsey, Principal Buyer

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

EJ USA, Inc.

0%

0%

Delivery of manhole riser rings are guaranteed not later 

than __ days after order placed.

EJ USA, Inc.

24

PORT CITY PIPE INC.

GRAND TOTAL

Bid Tabulation

lindseyc@jccal.org

205-214-8589

ITB 95-22

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 

renewed for 2nd year  ___ % 0%

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 

renewed for 3rd year  ___ % 0%

YES

EEOC Form

Debarment Statement

Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify)

Signature Page

CONTACTS:

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

30

PORT CITY PIPE 

INC.

Manufacturer name of equipment being bid by your 

company

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT

mailto:lindseyc@jccal.org
mailto:lindseyc@jccal.org

